
MON D A Y T U E S D A Y W E D N E S D A Y T H U R S D A Y F R I D A Y

Fitness
Jumping Jack Squat
High Knees Jog in Place
Side to Side Bounding
Do each exercise for 30
seconds then rest  for 1
minute.
Repeat 3 T imes
 

Fitness
Kneel ing Hip Stretch
Butterf ly Stretch
Tr iceps Stretch
Complete each stretch
for 30 seconds on each
side.

Fitness
Side Arm Raises
Push-Ups from Knees
Arm and Leg Raise
Do 10 of each exercise 
Rest for 1  minute.
Complete 3 T imes
 

F i tness :  
Forward Jacks
Mountain Cl imbers
Frog Jumps
Do each exercise for 30
seconds then rest  for 1
minute.
 
 
 
 

Fitness Friday
Chal lenge
60 Second seated wal l
squat.  Modif icat ion
seated squat with arms
out.  Facebook page of
you doing the chal lenge.    

Nutrit ion Tip  
Buy vegetables in
season.  They cost  less
and are l ike ly to be at
their  peak f lavor.  

Nutrit ion Tip  
Cut up vegetables
such as carrots,
cucumbers,  peppers
and caul if lower as a
quick afternoon
snack.  
 

Nutrit ion Tip
Gri l l  vegetable kabobs
as part  of  a barbecue
meal .   Try tomatoes,
mushrooms, green
peppers and onions.  
 

Nutrit ion Tip
Dip your veggies in
hummus or make a dip
from pla in greek yogurt
and spices for a healthy
snack.  
 

Nutrit ion Tip
Include chopped
vegetables in pasta
sauce and as pizza
toppings.  

Healthy Athletes Tip
Wash your hands under
warm water with soap
for at  least  20
seconds.Wash them
frequent ly throughout
the day.  

Healthy Athletes Tip 
Get your blood pressure
checked.  

Healthy Athletes Tip
Turn down the volume
whi le watching TV or
l istening to music to
protect your ears.  

Healthy Athletes Tip
Floss your teeth at
least  once a day.
Brush at  least  twice a
day.  See your dent ist
for a c leaning every 6
months.  
 

Healthy Athletes Tip
Check in with a fami ly
member or fr iend.  
 Let  them know how
you are doing.  
 

May in Motion 

May 18th-22nd 

https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-endurance-level-1
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-endurance-level-4
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-endurance-level-4
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-endurance-level-4
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-flexibility-level-3
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-flexibility-level-3
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-flexibility-level-3
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-flexibility-level-3
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-strength-level-2
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-strength-level-3
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-strength-level-3
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-strength-level-3
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-endurance-level-3
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-endurance-level-3
https://resources.specialolympics.org/video-endurance-level-3
https://www.facebook.com/SONEHealthWellness/
https://www.ams.usda.gov/local-food-directories/farmersmarkets
https://www.allrecipes.com/recipe/229166/grilled-veggie-skewers/
https://www.allrecipes.com/recipe/229166/grilled-veggie-skewers/
https://www.allrecipes.com/recipe/229166/grilled-veggie-skewers/
https://ifoodreal.com/healthy-veggie-dip/
https://ifoodreal.com/healthy-veggie-dip/
https://www.pillsbury.com/recipes/easy-crescent-veggie-pizza/4b2c60ae-69e5-4a1a-bed1-219a69cd4514
https://www.pillsbury.com/recipes/easy-crescent-veggie-pizza/4b2c60ae-69e5-4a1a-bed1-219a69cd4514
https://youtu.be/d914EnpU4Fo
https://health.gov/myhealthfinder/topics/doctor-visits/screening-tests/get-your-blood-pressure-checked
https://health.gov/myhealthfinder/topics/doctor-visits/screening-tests/get-your-blood-pressure-checked

